

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 North Pace Blvd Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE: **August 9, 2013**

BID TITLE & REFERENCE: Art Paper, Bid #133204

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual pricing agreement to provide art paper supplies as stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse. Eighty-two (82) items bid and eighty-two (82) items awarded. Items will be purchased on an as needed basis to replenish the Central Warehouse inventory. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: September 1, 2013 through August 31, 2014.

REQUESTED BY:

Central Warehouse

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Commercial Art Supply, Riviera Beach,	FL 2	\$ 500.00
DGS Educational Products, Delray Bead		9,000.00
Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL	65	37,600.00
School Specialty, Greenville, WI	8	600.00
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:	FUNDING SOURCE:	
\$47,700.00 Est. / Yr.	General Fund (1110)	
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:		
ECSD Bid	Responses Received:	12 Bids Rejected: 1
DATE AND TIME POSTED:		
August 9, 2013, 2:30PM CST		

9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD PENSACOLA, FL 32505

BID TABULATION

Date: 25-Jul-13
Bid Number: 133204
Bid Title: Art Paper

** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business

Recommended Award

	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	1/Bo	order (Black)		2/Bord	ler (Azure Blu	e)	3/Bor	der (Dark Blu	e)	4/B	order (Brown)	
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS
F	Pyramid		\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3
0	Quill	5%	\$1.48	\$1.55		No Bid	No Bid		\$1.48	\$1.55		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30	
F	Smith Office		\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3

Items 1-11 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	5/Bo	rder (Canary)		6/Borde	r (Emerald Gre	een)	7/Bord	der (Nile Gree	n)	8/Bo	rder (Orange)	
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS
F	Pyramid		\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3
0	Quill	5%	\$1.48	\$1.55		\$1.48	\$1.55		No Bid	No Bid		\$1.48	\$1.55	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30	
F	Smith Office		\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3

Items 1-11 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	El Drof	9/Bord	ler (Flame Red	d)	10/E	order (White)		11/B	order (Violet)		12/	Kraft (Black)	
**	Bidder Name	FL. Pref. Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1.3	\$0.82	\$0.82	1, 3	\$27.08	\$27.08	1
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$1.19	\$1.19	A, NS	\$29.75	\$29.75	16
F	Pyramid		\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$0.87	\$0.87	3	\$27.39	\$27.39	
0	Quill	5%	\$1.48	\$1.55		\$1.48	\$1.55		\$1.48	\$1.55		\$38.59	\$40.52	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	\$1.68	\$1.76	20, 3	No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30		\$1.24	\$1.30		\$34.88	\$36.62	
F	Smith Office		\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.85	\$0.85	21, 3	\$28.60	\$28.60	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$0.81	\$0.85	21, 3	\$27.15	\$28.51	21

Items 1-11 awarded as a lot

Items 12-20 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	13/	Kraft (Blue)		14/1	(raft (Canary)		15/	Kraft (Green)		16/	(Craft (Orange)	
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$25.05	\$25.05	1	\$29.28	\$29.28	1	\$23.28	\$23.28	1	\$29.28	\$29.28	1
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$28.26	\$28.26	16	\$32.41	\$32.41	16	\$26.42	\$26.42	16	\$32.22	\$32.22	16
F	Pyramid		\$25.29	\$25.29		\$29.59	\$29.59		\$23.49	\$23.49		\$29.59	\$29.59	
0	Quill	5%	\$55.63	\$58.41		\$41.78	\$43.87		\$33.44	\$35.11		\$44.45	\$46.67	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$29.13	\$30.59		\$39.13	\$41.09		\$29.36	\$30.83		\$40.84	\$42.88	
F	Smith Office		\$26.42	\$26.42		\$30.90	\$30.90		\$24.56	\$24.56		\$30.90	\$30.90	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$25.10	\$26.36	21	\$29.35	\$30.82	21	\$23.34	\$24.51	21	\$29.35	\$30.82	21

Items 12-20 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	17/	Kraft (Pink)		18	/Kraft (Red)		19/	Kraft (White)		20/K	raft (Sky Blue))
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$28.51	\$28.51	1	\$26.47	\$26.47	1	\$23.75	\$23.75	1	\$28.86	\$28.86	1
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$30.88	\$30.88	16	\$29.05	\$29.05	16	\$27.25	\$27.25	16	\$31.70	\$31.70	16
	Pyramid		\$28.69	\$28.69		\$26.69	\$26.69		\$24.19	\$24.19		\$29.09	\$29.09	
0	Quill	5%	\$52.96	\$55.61	A, NS	\$37.63	\$39.51		\$34.61	\$36.34		\$44.64	\$46.87	
	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$37.45	\$39.32		\$34.50	\$36.23		\$29.88	\$31.37		\$39.72	\$41.71	
F	Smith Office		\$30.00	\$30.00		\$27.93	\$27.93		\$25.27	\$25.27		\$30.45	\$30.45	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$28.49	\$29.91	21	\$26.53	\$27.86	21	\$24.01	\$25.21	21	\$28.92	\$30.37	21

Items 12-20 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	21/K	(raft (Brown)		22/18" Coi	nst. (Holiday C	Green)	23/18"	Const. (Yello	w)	24/18	" Const. (Viole	et)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$15.60	\$15.60	1	\$4.96	\$4.96	1, 4	\$4.41	\$4.41	1, 4	\$4.62	\$4.62	1, 4
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$18.95	\$18.95		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$17.49	\$17.49		\$4.98	\$4.98	17, 4	\$4.43	\$4.43	17, 4	\$4.65	\$4.65	17, 4
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4
0	School Specialty	5%	\$17.94	\$18.84		No Bid	No Bid		\$4.83	\$5.07		\$4.83	\$5.07	
F	Smith Office		\$16.40	\$16.40	21	\$5.25	\$5.25	21, 4	\$4.65	\$4.65	21, 4	\$4.88	\$4.88	21, 4
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$15.55	\$16.33	21	\$4.96	\$5.21	21, 4	\$4.42	\$4.64	21, 4	\$4.63	\$4.86	21, 4

Items 22-39 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	25/18" C	onst. (Turquo	ise)	26/18" Cd	nst. (Holiday	Red)	27/18	" Const. (Red)	28/18"	Const. (Mager	nta)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes									
F	AFP Industries		\$5.03	\$5.03	1, 4	\$4.67	\$4.67	1, 4	\$4.32	\$4.32	1, 4	\$5.02	\$5.02	1, 4
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$5.06	\$5.06	17, 4	\$4.70	\$4.70	17, 4	\$4.34	\$4.34	17, 4	\$5.04	\$5.04	17, 4
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid										
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4
0	School Specialty	5%	\$5.44	\$5.71		\$4.91	\$5.16		\$4.83	\$5.07		\$4.83	\$5.07	
F	Smith Office		\$5.31	\$5.31	21, 4	\$4.93	\$4.93	21, 4	\$4.55	\$4.55	21, 4	\$5.30	\$5.30	21, 4
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$5.04	\$5.29	21, 4	\$4.68	\$4.91	21, 4	\$4.33	\$4.55	21, 4	\$5.02	\$5.27	21, 4

Items 22-39 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	29/18" Cor	nst. (Festive G	reen)	30/18	" Const. (Pink	()	31/18" (Const. (Sky Bl	ue)	32/18	" Const. (Blue	e)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$5.08	\$5.08	1, 4	\$4.53	\$4.53	1, 4	\$4.24	\$4.24	1, 4	\$4.66	\$4.66	1, 4
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$5.11	\$5.11	17, 4	\$4.55	\$4.55	17, 4	\$4.26	\$4.26	17, 4	\$4.69	\$4.69	17, 4
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4
0	School Specialty	5%	\$5.44	\$5.71		\$4.83	\$5.07		\$4.55	\$4.78		\$4.94	\$5.19	
F	Smith Office		\$5.36	\$5.36	21, 4	\$4.78	\$4.78	21, 4	\$4.50	\$4.50	21, 4	\$4.92	\$4.92	21, 4
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$5.09	\$5.34	21, 4	\$4.54	\$4.77	21, 4	\$4.25	\$4.46	21, 4	\$4.67	\$4.90	21, 4

Items 22-39 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	33/18"	Const. (Black	c)	34/18" Cd	onst. (Assortn	nent)	35/18" Co	nst. (Warm Bı	rown)	36/18	" Const. (Gold	d)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$3.96	\$3.96	1, 4	\$5.12	\$5.12	1, 4	\$4.38	\$4.38	1, 4	\$4.55	\$4.55	1, 4
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$3.99	\$3.99	17, 4	\$5.15	\$5.15	17, 4	\$4.41	\$4.41	17, 4	\$4.58	\$4.58	17, 4
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4
0	School Specialty	5%	\$4.83	\$5.07		\$5.55	\$5.83		\$4.55	\$4.78		\$4.55	\$4.78	
F	Smith Office		\$4.18	\$4.18	21, 4	\$5.40	\$5.40	21, 4	\$4.62	\$4.62	21, 4	\$4.80	\$4.80	21, 4
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$3.98	\$4.18	21, 4	\$5.13	\$5.39	21, 4	\$4.39	\$4.61	21, 4	\$4.56	\$4.79	21, 4

Items 22-39 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	37/18" Co	nst. (Dark Bro	own)	38/18"	Const. (Oranç	ge)	39/18" Co	nst. (Brillant I	_ime)	40/18"	Const. (Salmo	on)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$4.39	\$4.39	1, 4	\$4.47	\$4.47	1, 4	\$5.08	\$5.08	1, 4	\$2.23	\$2.23	1, 5
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$4.42	\$4.42	17, 4	\$4.50	\$4.50	17, 4	\$5.11	\$5.11	17, 4	\$2.25	\$2.25	17, 5
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$5.64	\$5.92	20, 4	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5
0	School Specialty	5%	\$4.55	\$4.78		\$4.94	\$5.19		\$4.94	\$5.19		\$2.28	\$2.39	
F	Smith Office		\$4.63	\$4.63	21, 4	\$4.72	\$4.72	21, 4	\$5.36	\$5.36	21, 4	\$2.35	\$2.35	21, 5
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$4.40	\$4.62	21, 4	\$4.48	\$4.70	21, 4	\$5.09	\$5.34	21, 4	\$2.24	\$2.35	21, 5

Items 22-39 awarded as a lot

Items 40-49 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	41/18" Co	nst. (Brillant L	ime)	42/18"	Const. (Orang	ge)	43/18" Co	nst. (Festive G	reen)	44/18	" Const. (Gray	y)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$2.23	\$2.23	1, 5	\$2.04	\$2.04	1, 5	\$2.35	\$2.35	1, 5	\$1.94	\$1.94	1, 5
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$2.25	\$2.25	17, 5	\$2.06	\$2.06	17, 5	\$2.37	\$2.37	17, 5	\$1.96	\$1.96	17, 5
0	Quill	5%	\$3.82	\$4.01		\$2.39	\$2.51		\$2.39	\$2.51		\$3.54	\$3.72	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5
0	School Specialty	5%	\$2.47	\$2.59		\$2.47	\$2.59		\$2.72	\$2.86		\$2.28	\$2.39	
F	Smith Office		\$2.35	\$2.35	21, 5	\$2.16	\$2.16	21, 5	\$2.49	\$2.49	21, 5	\$2.05	\$2.05	21, 5
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$2.24	\$2.35	21, 5	\$2.05	\$2.15	21, 5	\$2.36	\$2.48	21, 5	\$1.95	\$2.05	21, 5

Items 40-49 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	45/18	" Const. (Pink)	46/18" Co	onst. (Dark Br	own)	47/18" Co	nst. (Warm B	rown)	48/18	3" Const. (Tan	1)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$2.06	\$2.06	1, 5	\$2.00	\$2.00	1, 5	\$1.88	\$1.88	1, 5	\$1.89	\$1.89	1, 5
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Pyramid		\$2.08	\$2.08	17, 5	\$2.02	\$2.02	17, 5	\$1.89	\$1.89	17, 5	\$1.91	\$1.91	17, 5
0	Quill	5%	\$3.00	\$3.15		\$2.39	\$2.51		\$4.00	\$4.20		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5
0	School Specialty	5%	\$2.41	\$2.53		\$2.28	\$2.39		\$2.28	\$2.39		\$2.28	\$2.39	
F	Smith Office		\$2.15	\$2.15	21, 5	\$2.12	\$2.12	21, 5	\$2.00	\$2.00	21, 5	\$2.00	\$2.00	21, 5
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$2.07	\$2.17	21. 5	\$2.01	\$2.11	21, 5	\$1.89	\$1.98	21, 5	\$1.90	\$2.00	21, 5

Items 40-49 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	49/18" Co	nst. (Bright W	hite)	50/20"	Tissue (Yello	w)	51/20"	Tissue (White	e)	52/20	" Tissue (Red	l)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$1.74	\$1.74	1, 5	\$1.69	\$1.69	1, 6	\$1.43	\$1.43	1, 6	\$1.69	\$1.69	1, 6
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		No Bid	No Bid		\$2.15	\$2.15		\$2.15	\$2.15		\$2.15	\$2.15	
F	Pyramid		\$1.75	\$1.75	17, 5	\$1.69	\$1.69	6	\$1.69	\$1.69	6	\$1.69	\$1.69	6
0	Quill	5%	\$2.44	\$2.56		\$2.94	\$3.09		\$1.89	\$1.98		\$2.94	\$3.09	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$2.40	\$2.52	20, 5	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.91	\$2.01		\$1.57	\$1.65		\$0.74	\$0.78		\$1.57	\$1.65	
F	Smith Office		\$1.84	\$1.84	21, 5	\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6	\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6	\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$1.75	\$1.84	21, 5	\$1.68	\$1.76	21, 6	\$1.43	\$1.50	21, 6	\$1.68	\$1.76	21, 6

Items 40-49 awarded as a lot

Items 50-56 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	53/20"	Tissue (Purpl	e)	54/20"	Tissue (Oranç	ge)	55/20"	Tissue (Gree	n)	56/20	" Tissue (Blue	e)
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$1.69	\$1.69	1, 6	\$1.69	\$1.69	1, 6	\$1.69	\$1.69	1, 6	\$1.69	\$1.69	1, 6
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$2.15	\$2.15		\$2.15	\$2.15		\$2.15	\$2.15		\$2.15	\$2.15	
F	Pyramid		\$1.69	\$1.69	6	\$1.69	\$1.69	6	\$1.69	\$1.69	6	\$1.69	\$1.69	6
0	Quill	5%	\$2.94	\$3.09		\$2.94	\$3.09		\$2.94	\$3.09		\$2.94	\$3.09	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.57	\$1.65		\$1.57	\$1.65		\$1.57	\$1.65		\$1.57	\$1.65	
F	Smith Office		\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6	\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6	\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6	\$1.77	\$1.77	21, 6
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$1.68	\$1.76	21, 6	\$1.68	\$1.76	21, 6	\$1.68	\$1.76	21, 6	\$1.68	\$1.76	21, 6

Items 50-56 awarded as a lot

	Bid Item #/Description	EL D. (57/Tiss	ue (Asst. Brig	ht)	58/Ti	ssue (Pomps)		59/Ti	ssue (Madras)	60/Tissue	(Asst. Transp	arent)
**	Bidder Name	FL. Pref. Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$1.57	\$1.57	1, 7	\$1.70	\$1.70	1, 7	\$3.91	\$3.91	1, 8	\$1.80	\$1.80	1, 9
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$2.45	\$2.45	A, NS	\$5.25	\$5.25		\$7.50	\$7.50		\$3.10	\$3.10	
F	Pyramid		\$1.59	\$1.59	7	\$1.75	\$1.75	7	\$3.98	\$3.98	8	\$1.80	\$1.80	9
0	Quill	5%	\$2.41	\$2.53		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$1.73	\$1.82	20, 7	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.63	\$1.71		\$1.79	\$1.88		\$4.54	\$4.77		\$1.84	\$1.93	
F	Smith Office		\$1.64	\$1.64	21, 7	\$1.78	\$1.78	21, 7	\$4.10	\$4.10	21, 8	\$1.89	\$1.89	21, 9
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$1.56	\$1.64	21, 7	\$1.69	\$1.77	21, 7	\$3.90	\$4.10	21, 8	\$1.79	\$1.88	21, 9

	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	61/12"	Fadeless (Due	et)	62/12" Fac	leless (All Pui	rpose)	63	Newsprint		64/D	rawing Paper	•
**	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$2.70	\$2.70	1, 10	\$3.35	\$3.35	1, 10	\$12.41	\$12.41	1, 11	\$21.87	\$21.87	2
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$8.50	\$8.50		\$8.50	\$8.50		\$29.95	\$29.95		\$36.40	\$36.40	
F	Pyramid		\$2.83	\$2.83	10	\$3.50	\$3.50	10	\$12.78	\$12.78	11	\$23.82	\$23.82	17, 18
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		\$3.60	\$3.78	20, 10	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$4.86	\$5.10		\$4.78	\$5.02		\$38.50	\$40.43		\$26.76	\$28.10	A, S
F	Smith Office		\$2.84	\$2.84	21, 10	\$3.51	\$3.51	21, 10	\$13.03	\$13.03	21, 11	\$25.00	\$25.00	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$2.69	\$2.82	21, 10	\$3.34	\$3.51	21, 10	\$12.38	\$13.00	21, 11	\$23.75	\$24.94	21

**	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	65/	65/Finger Paint			66/Manila		(67/Tracing		68	/Watercolor	
	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$2.27	\$2.27	2, 12	\$6.62	\$6.62	1, 13	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$28.50	\$28.50	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$3.50	\$3.50		\$10.70	\$10.70		\$5.95	\$5.95		\$32.95	\$32.95	7
F	Pyramid		\$2.50	\$2.50	12	\$6.62	\$6.62	17, 13	No Bid	No Bid		\$28.49	\$28.49	19
0	Quill	5%	\$5.66	\$5.94		\$8.16	\$8.57		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$2.58	\$2.71		\$7.71	\$8.10		\$4.34	\$4.56		\$23.01	\$24.16	A, NS
F	Smith Office		\$2.70	\$2.70	21, 12	\$7.00	\$7.00	21, 13	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$2.57	\$2.70	21, 12	\$6.60	\$6.93	21, 13	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	

**	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	69/Scra	atch (Multicolo	or)	70/S	cratch (Black)		71.	/Neon (Red)		72/1	Neon (Yellow)	
	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$4.38	\$4.38	1, 14	\$4.38	\$4.38	1, 14
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$6.90	\$6.90		\$5.35	\$5.35		\$2.49	\$2.49		\$2.49	\$2.49	
F	Pyramid		\$5.95	\$5.95		\$5.29	\$5.29		\$4.95	\$4.95	14	\$4.95	\$4.95	14
0	Quill	5%	\$7.27	\$7.63		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$8.06	\$8.46	A, NS	\$3.12	\$3.28	A, NS	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	Smith Office		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$4.36	\$4.58	21, 14	\$4.36	\$4.58	21, 14

Items 71-75 awarded as a lot

**	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	73/N	leon (Green)		74/N	leon (Orange)		75/	Neon (Pink)		76/C	hart (24"x32")	
	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$4.38	\$4.38	1, 14	\$4.38	\$4.38	1, 14	\$4.38	\$4.38	1, 14	\$2.06	\$2.06	2, 10
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$2.49	\$2.49		\$2.49	\$2.49		\$2.49	\$2.49		\$3.38	\$3.38	A, NS
F	Pyramid		\$4.95	\$4.95	14	\$4.95	\$4.95	14	\$4.95	\$4.95	14	\$2.07	\$2.07	10
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$3.48	\$3.65	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$2.46	\$2.58	
F	Smith Office		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		\$2.18	\$2.18	21, 10
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$4.36	\$4.58	21, 14	\$4.36	\$4.58	21, 14	\$4.36	\$4.58	21, 14	\$2.07	\$2.17	21, 10

Items 71-75 awarded as a lot

**	Bid Item #/Description	FL. Pref.	77/C	hart (24"x16")		78/B	oard (Railroad	1)	79/Boar	d (Poster, Wh	ite)	80/Boar	d (Poster, Bla	ick)
	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		\$1.13	\$1.13	2, 7	\$13.87	\$13.87	2	\$13.97	\$13.97	2	\$5.83	\$5.83	2
F	Commercial Art Supply		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$1.82	\$1.82		\$12.00	\$12.00		\$14.68	\$14.68		\$6.29	\$6.29	A, NS
F	Pyramid		\$1.15	\$1.15	7	\$12.07	\$12.07	17	\$14.76	\$14.76	17	\$5.94	\$5.94	17
0	Quill	5%	\$1.98	\$2.08		No Bid	No Bid		\$20.38	\$21.40		No Bid	No Bid	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	\$2.17	\$2.28	20, 7	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$1.20	\$1.26		\$15.76	\$16.55		\$16.23	\$17.04	A, S	\$7.16	\$7.52	
F	Smith Office		\$1.20	\$1.20	21, 7	\$16.33	\$16.33		\$16.10	\$16.10		\$6.23	\$6.23	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	\$1.14	\$1.20	21, 7	\$15.51	\$16.29	21	\$15.27	\$16.03	21	\$5.92	\$6.22	21

**	Bid Item #/Descripton	FL. Pref.	81/Illus	tration (20"x30	0")	82/Board	l (Mat, Gray/W	hite)		1			1	
	Bidder Name	Adj.	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes	Bid Price	Eval. Price	Notes
F	AFP Industries		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			\$0.00			\$0.00	
F	Commercial Art Supply		\$1.30	\$1.30		\$5.20	\$5.20	15		\$0.00			\$0.00	
F	DGS Educational Products		\$4.95	\$4.95		\$8.95	\$8.95			\$0.00			\$0.00	
F	Pyramid		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			\$0.00			\$0.00	
0	Quill	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			\$0.00			\$0.00	
0	S&S Worldwide	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			\$0.00			\$0.00	
0	School Specialty	5%	\$21.95	\$23.05	A, NS	\$40.14	\$42.15	A, NS		\$0.00			\$0.00	
F	Smith Office		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			\$0.00			\$0.00	
0	Standard Stationery	5%	No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid			\$0.00			\$0.00	

NOTES:

A Alternate

NS No Sample

- S Sample provided
- 1 Pacon Minimum Order \$3100.00
- 2 Roselle Minimum Order \$4200.00
- 3 Order in Multiples of 60 rolls per color
- 4 Order in Multiples of 15 packs per color
- 5 Order in Multiples of 25 packs per color
- 6 Order in Multiples of 10 packs per color
- 7 Order in Multiples of 24
- 8 Order in Multiples of 6
- 9 Order in Multiples of 25
- 10 Order in Multiples of 12
- 11 Order in Multiples of 3
- 12 Order in Multiples of 10
- 13 Order in Multiples of 4
- 14 Order in Multiples of 20 packs per color
- 15 Minimum Order: 70 sheets
- 16 Minimum Order: 185 rolls, assorted
- 17 Pacon Minimum Order \$2600.00
- 18 Order in full cases, 1 rm/case
- 19 Order in full cases, 2 pks/case
- 20 Pacon Minimum Order \$2800.00
- 21 Pacon Minimum Order \$3000.00

P-card Bid Reference:

No AFP: NA
No Commercial Art: NA
No DGS: NA

No Pyramid: #133204ESCAMBIA

 Yes
 Quill:
 13-6869

 Yes
 S&S:
 133204

 Yes
 School Specialty:
 7774848236

 NA
 Smith:
 133204

 No
 Standard:
 Bid #57004

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/finance/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School Board Rules. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address. Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie

John Dombroskie, Director Purchasing Department